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Dec 20, 2017 at 12:41 AM

Dear Dr. Hernadewita.

Herewith | am sending the Jurnal for fullfilment the subject quality improvement and six sigma.
Looking forward for confirmation, and input.
Best Regards,

Tulus Puji R

From: EPH Journal [mailto:Editor@ephjournal.com]

Sent: 02 February 2018 17:01

To: Tulus Puji Ruswanto

Subject: Re: Confirmation for the submission of Paper Journal.

Dear Author,
Greetings!

It gives us immense pleasure to inform you that we are sending you the soft copy of the paper(s)
and certificate; you have published in our journal. You may print it on normal A-4 size bond paper.

It is to inform to your good-self that the contribution by the Author(s) concerned is duly available
on our website i.e. http://ephjournal.com/

In case of any query, please feel free to contact editor@ephjournal.com.

Thank you for your interest in our Journal.
Best Regards

Editor


http://ephjournal.com/
mailto:editor@ephjournal.com
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On 2/1/2018 2:33 PM, Tulus Puji Ruswanto wrote:
Good afternoon
Please confirm when | will got good news from your side for the published journal information.

Best Regards,

Tulus Puji R

From: EPH Journal [mailto:Editor@ephjournal.com]

Sent: 01 February 2018 12:50

To: Tulus Puji Ruswanto

Subject: Re: Confirmation for the submission of Paper Journal.

Dear Author(s)

Greetings!

We acknowledge with thanks to you for submitting the copy right form and publication fee $80
for manuscript reference no. (477) towards the publication in EPH. Your paper will be will be

Publish in January Issue.

If you have any questions regarding your submission, please feel free to contact us
at editor@ephjournal.com Thank you for your interest in our Journal.

Best Regards

EPH Journal

From: Tulus Puji Ruswanto [mailto:tuluspujiruswanto78@gmail.com]
Sent: 26 January 2018 07:59

To: 'chief-editor@ephjournal.com’

Cc: 'Tulus Puji Ruswanto'

Subject: Confirmation for the submission of Paper Journal.

Good Morning


http://ephjournal.com/
mailto:Editor@ephjournal.com
mailto:editor@ephjournal.com

May | introduce my self, My Name Tulus Puji Ruswanto. | am student of magister Industrial Engineering
from Mercu Buana University Indonesia.

| already submit for my paper for journal publishing in ephjournal.
| want to know when the submission review already done , and my journal is accepted.

If the above process is OK and my Paper will be published , could you explain to me about the payment of
the charge ? and How much ?

Looking forward for your feedback and my submission is accepted.

Best Regards,

Tulus Puji R

FW: [se] New notification from EPH - International Journal of Science And Engineering (ISSN:
2454 - 2016)

Tulus Puji Ruswanto <tuluspujiruswanto78@gmail.com>

hernadewita@mercubuana.ac.id,'Herna Dewita'
Feb 28, 2018 at 12:32 AM
Dear Ibu. Dr. Hernadewita.
For your information
Best Regards,

Tulus Puji R

From: EPH Journal Admin [mailto:info@ephjournal.com]

Sent: 27 February 2018 19:36

To: tulus puji ruswanto

Subject: [se] New natification from EPH - International Journal of Science And Engineering
(ISSN: 2454 - 2016)

You have a new notification from EPH - International Journal of Science And Engineering (ISSN:
2454 - 2016):

An issue has been published.



Link: http://www.ephjournal.com/index.php/sel/issue/current

Naeem Akhtar

Chief Editor
Naeem Akhtar
EPH - International Journal of Science And Engineering (ISSN: 2454 - 2016)
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